
Von: Anderson Chopra [mailto:eheartinstitute@yahoo.in]  
Gesendet: Samstag, 8. Dezember 2012 09:13 
An: Rittergut Positz 
Betreff: Lunch Booking Confirmation 
 
Hello, 
 
Thanks for your email, I will make a deposit payment to you, this is because we are 
not yet sure of what we might like to eat and drink. Our menu request will reach you 
before our arrival when we are sure of what to eat and drink.  
 
To make sure that everything is arranged before our arrival, we wish to make 
advance payment to confirm the booking. I want to tell you that we will make 
arrangement with a Tour organizer agency that will book our Flights and provide us 
with other logistic needs during our stay. 
 
Also, the payment will come from sponsors in the United Kingdom. Already they have 
issued out a certified European Bank check to cover all our travelling expenses which 
includes food, flight tickets, accommodation and other logistics during our stay. 
 
Since you are the first booking we have confirmed, we wish to issue this cheque 
payment to you. Therefore when you receive the cheque, cash it and deduct money 
for the cost of your services. The remaining money will be for the Tour organizer 
agency (The detail will be provided to you when we have concluded). 
 
Upon your confirmation of the payment, I will forward to you our detailed Menu. 
 
Kindly provide the following information for the cheque payment to be issued to you. 
 
(1) YOUR FULL NAME (As it should appear on the cheque):  
(2) YOUR POSTAL ADDRESS (where to send the check):  
(3) CONTACT TELEPHONE NUMBERS:  
(4) ESTIMATED COST OF SERVICES: 
 
NOTE: WE WILL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR ANY TAX AND FEES THIS WILL 
ATTRACT. 
 
We hope to receive the best of service. 
Your prompt response is highly needed. 
 
My Regards, 
Dr. Anderson Chopra, 
ESCORTS HEART & SUPERSPECIALITY INSTITUTE LTD., MAJITHA VERKA 
BYPASS ROAD , AMRITSAR , INDIA. 
 
 
--- On Fri, 7/12/12, Rittergut Positz <info@rittergut-positz.de> wrote: 
 
From: Rittergut Positz <info@rittergut-positz.de> 
Subject: AW: Lunch Booking 
To: eheartinstitute@yahoo.in 
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Date: Friday, 7 December, 2012, 11:04 AM 
Hallo Dr. Anderson, 
 
we can offer Lunch from 2nd to 9th February 2013(8 days) by 12noon each day for 
10 guests. 
What do you want to eat? 
We only accept cash payments. Please send us your Phone number and adress of 
your Department. 
 
Viele Grüße 
Stefan Schwarzer 
Rittergut Positz GmbH 
 
Tel: 03647 504535 
Fax: 03647 504536 
www.rittergut-positz.de 
 
-----Ursprüngliche Nachricht----- 
Von: Anderson Chopra [mailto:eheartinstitute@indiatimes.com]  
Gesendet: Montag, 3. Dezember 2012 07:38 
An: Rittergut Positz 
Betreff: Lunch Booking 
 
Good Morning / guten Morgen, 
 
Am not sure if you received my last email. Here is it again;Can I book Lunch in your 
facility for 10 guests from my Department arriving from India to your country?  We will 
come for Lunch from 2nd to 9th February 2013(8 days) by 12noon each day. Get 
back to me with your service cost if you have availability.  
I do hope you accept Euro check as regards payment. Let me know if you accept 
check payment in advance from Europe Bank. Thank you and looking forward to your 
urgent response. 
 
Yours Sincerely 
Dr. Anderson Chopra 
Email: eheartinstitute@yahoo.in 
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